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Local Webinar on “UNiTE to End Violence Against 
Women" on International day for the Elimination of 
Violence Against Women Women Empowerment Cell GDCGNP

Local Webinar was conducted on “UNiTE to End 
Violence Against Women” on 25.11.2022 from 2:30 
to 4:30 to get sensitized on women’s issues and work 
for a violence free society as a part of UNO’s 
initiative of 16 days of activism in the light of the 
international day for the Elimination of Violence 
Against Women on 25th November. Dr. V. Sandhya, 
Lecturer in Zoology, YVNR Govt. Degree College, 
Kaikaluru, Dr. K. Swarupa Rani, Lecturer in Economics 
and Dr. Ch. Chaitanya, Lecturer in Botany of 
SCHVPMR Govt. Degree College, Ganapavaram acted 
as resource persons. 228 candidates participated in 
this semina 21-22 228

National Webinar on “Violence Against Women: 
Prebirth to Death

Women Empowerment Cell GDCGNP 
in collaboration with SR & BGMR Govt. 
College(A), Khammam

Conducted National webinar on “Violence Against 
Women: Prebirth to Death” in collaboration with SR 
& BGMR Govt. College(A), Khammam, Sridhar, 
Editor, Computer Era Magazine, R. Santhi Reddy, 
Advocate, High Court, Hyderabad, Ms. K. Deva 
Haneesha, Asst. Professor, Anatha Law College, 
Hyderabad acted as resource persons and covered 
the issues Cyber Crime, Forms of violence against 
women, legal provisions. 350 students and staff 
participated in this webinar 21-22 350

Awareness Sessions on “International Women's 
Day” Women Empowerment Cell GDCGNP

Invited three guests from three different fields, a 
school teacher, village sarpanch and a business 
woman who is the mother of one of our students. 
They shared their own experiences interacted with 
students. Students performed two skits to get 
everyone revived and attentive on gender issues like 
dowry, femicide etc. students displayed hand written 
placards that “we are in'' in climate action 
representing the theme of the women’s day this year 
“Gender Equality Today for a Sustainable Future”. At 
the end, felicitated guests with saplings to spread 
awareness amongst the public to plant and grow 
more trees for a better environment. 21-22 122

Screening of a Movie “AWE” Women Empowerment Cell GDCGNP

To sensitize students, screening a movie “AWE”,
deals with mental illness, abuse, gender and 
sexuality. 21-22 40



Awarenss Talk on Anti-Ragging Anti-Ragging Committee & NSS Units GDC GNP

Ragging is a menace to society. Fortunately, the 
college proves to be a ragging-free campus. 
However, in order to create awareness on the ill-
effects of ragging, an awareness session was 
organized. In the session, college incharge Principal 
Sri P.Madhu Raju, Special Branch CI. J. Kiran and
Ganapavaram SI. Sri Vemula Venkateswara Rao 
interacted with the students. 21-22 72

 Awareness Talk on “Savithri Bai Phule Jayanthi” Women Empowerment Cell GDCGNP

Highlighting the ideals for which Savitri Bai Phule 
lived for her entire life, her jayanti was celebrated in 
the college, involving the students in organizing the 
event. 21-22 140


